

CITY OF YONKERS / YONKERS PUBLIC SCHOOLS
 PURCHASE ORDER # 1787
 Yonkers, New York 10791-3888
 Phone 914-377-4831

Item: 1787-2008
 Total Bids Rec'd: 5
 Name: Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 1)
 Buyer: Nicole Guad

Item: 1787-2008
 Total Bids Rec'd: 5
 Name: Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 1)
 Buyer: Nicole Guad

Item: 1787-2008
 Total Bids Rec'd: 5
 Name: Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 1)
 Buyer: Nicole Guad

Item: 1787-2008
 Total Bids Rec'd: 5
 Name: Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 1)
 Buyer: Nicole Guad

Item: 1787-2008
 Total Bids Rec'd: 5
 Name: Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 1)
 Buyer: Nicole Guad

Item: 1787-2008
 Total Bids Rec'd: 5
 Name: Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 1)
 Buyer: Nicole Guad

Item: 1787-2008
 Total Bids Rec'd: 5
 Name: Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 1)
 Buyer: Nicole Guad

Item: 1787-2008
 Total Bids Rec'd: 5
 Name: Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 1)
 Buyer: Nicole Guad

Item: 1787-2008
 Total Bids Rec'd: 5
 Name: Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 1)
 Buyer: Nicole Guad

Item: 1787-2008
 Total Bids Rec'd: 5
 Name: Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 1)
 Buyer: Nicole Guad

Item: 1787-2008
 Total Bids Rec'd: 5
 Name: Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 1)
 Buyer: Nicole Guad

Item: 1787-2008
 Total Bids Rec'd: 5
 Name: Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 1)
 Buyer: Nicole Guad

Item: 1787-2008
 Total Bids Rec'd: 5
 Name: Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 1)
 Buyer: Nicole Guad

Item: 1787-2008
 Total Bids Rec'd: 5
 Name: Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 1)
 Buyer: Nicole Guad

Item: 1787-2008
 Total Bids Rec'd: 5
 Name: Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 1)
 Buyer: Nicole Guad

Item: 1787-2008
 Total Bids Rec'd: 5
 Name: Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 1)
 Buyer: Nicole Guad

Item: 1787-2008
 Total Bids Rec'd: 5
 Name: Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 1)
 Buyer: Nicole Guad

Item: 1787-2008
 Total Bids Rec'd: 5
 Name: Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 1)
 Buyer: Nicole Guad

Item: 1787-2008
 Total Bids Rec'd: 5
 Name: Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 1)
 Buyer: Nicole Guad

Item: 1787-2008
 Total Bids Rec'd: 5
 Name: Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 1)
 Buyer: Nicole Guad

Item: 1787-2008
 Total Bids Rec'd: 5
 Name: Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 1)
 Buyer: Nicole Guad

GROUP # 1

Item No.	Qty	UOM	Part #	Manufacturer	Description	Unit Cost	Est. Cost	Vendor #	Vendor Name	Address	City	State	Zip	Phone	Fax	Website	Notes			
1	2,643	each	47007-494	Ward's Science	Thin liquid crystal temperature strips (with Fahrenheit scale, 48 to 93)	\$0.44	\$1,163.80	47007-494	Ward's Science	155 Broadway Pharmacia, NY 12915 Central Islip, NY 11724	NY	11724	516-338-1100							
2	186	pack	32014	Ward's Science	Staples push pin, clear 500/pack	\$1.36	\$2,529.60	32014	Ward's Science	155 Broadway Pharmacia, NY 12915 Central Islip, NY 11724	NY	11724	516-338-1100							
3	5,290	each	15-181-512	Fisher Scientific	Fisherbrand™ Clear Safety Goggles	\$0.47	\$2,486.10	15-181-512	Fisher Scientific	300 North Zeeb Road Hampton, NJ 07727	NJ	07727	908-772-7887							
4	2,643	each	03-007-40	Fisher Scientific	Fisherbrand™ Polystyrene Graduated Cylinders (50 ml)	\$0.30	\$793.50	03-007-40	Fisher Scientific	300 North Zeeb Road Hampton, NJ 07727	NJ	07727	908-772-7887							
5	387	each	51-5100A	Zollner	Zollner® 51-5100A Stainless Steel Bottle Wieg. Pail	\$42.34	\$16,385.58	51-5100A	Zollner	10000 Zollner Rd Zollner, NY 12992	NY	12992	518-787-7474							
6	1,887	pack	879002P/4	United Scientific Supplies	United Scientific Supplies, Inc O CELL BATTERY HOLDER 1/4"	\$0.99	\$1,867.53	879002P/4	United Scientific Supplies	17000 1st St Carmel, NY 12024	NY	12024	518-384-7676							
7	3,650	each	PH000A/1	Sunmark	Sunmark™ 1 1/2 in. Power Cords with Protective Vinyl Sheathed Adaptor Cbs on Each End (50.29 each 7.540)	\$0.11	\$402.05	PH000A/1	Sunmark	10000 Zollner Rd Zollner, NY 12992	NY	12992	518-787-7474							
8	5,334	each	756481	Carolina	Lamp Receptacles - plastic	\$0.30	\$1,600.20	756481	Carolina	10000 Zollner Rd Zollner, NY 12992	NY	12992	518-787-7474							
9	1,490	each	829002	United Scientific Supplies	United Scientific Supplies Screw Post Knife Switch Three Knife Switch	\$2.35	\$3,491.50	829002	United Scientific Supplies	17000 1st St Carmel, NY 12024	NY	12024	518-384-7676							
10	3,654	each	721613	Carolina	Plastic Graduated Cylinders - 100 ml	\$1.13	\$4,129.62	721613	Carolina	10000 Zollner Rd Zollner, NY 12992	NY	12992	518-787-7474							
11	818	each	983106	Carolina	Snapswitch	\$1.54	\$1,258.92	983106	Carolina	10000 Zollner Rd Zollner, NY 12992	NY	12992	518-787-7474							
12	534	each	539206	Walter Products	Walter MAT series Condens Compound Microscope	\$115.00	\$61,050.00	539206	Walter Products	10000 Zollner Rd Zollner, NY 12992	NY	12992	518-787-7474							
13	815	each	745513	Carolina	Inversion Thermometer - 10 to 110° C (10 to 230° F)	\$1.80	\$1,467.00	745513	Carolina	10000 Zollner Rd Zollner, NY 12992	NY	12992	518-787-7474							
14	275	pack	976643	Carolina	Wisher, Pils, Etc. 7 1/2 in. Pack of 200	\$11.00	\$3,025.00	976643	Carolina	10000 Zollner Rd Zollner, NY 12992	NY	12992	518-787-7474							
15	843	each	721253	Carolina	Pyrex Glass Griffin Beakers, Low Form, Heavy Duty - 1000 ml	\$10.00	\$8,430.00	721253	Carolina	10000 Zollner Rd Zollner, NY 12992	NY	12992	518-787-7474							
16	843	each	701005	Bird King	Economy Hot Plate, Double Burner	\$18.48	\$15,381.36	701005	Bird King	10000 Zollner Rd Zollner, NY 12992	NY	12992	518-787-7474							
17	943	each	702955	Carolina	Crucible Tong, Heat-Resistant	\$2.20	\$2,076.60	702955	Carolina	10000 Zollner Rd Zollner, NY 12992	NY	12992	518-787-7474							
18	275	each	971633	Carolina	Pert Dish, with Lim. Pack of 20	\$4.80	\$1,320.00	971633	Carolina	10000 Zollner Rd Zollner, NY 12992	NY	12992	518-787-7474							
19	1,788	each	626540	Carolina	Utility Forceps, Stainless Steel, Curved, 6 in	\$1.40	\$2,503.20	626540	Carolina	10000 Zollner Rd Zollner, NY 12992	NY	12992	518-787-7474							

CITY OF TOMPKINS / VANDERBILT PUBLIC SCHOOLS		PURCHASING DEPARTMENT		Vendor # 1 *****		Vendor # 2 *****		Vendor # 3 *****		Vendor # 4 *****		Vendor # 5 *****		Vendor # 6 *****		Vendor # 7 *****		Vendor # 8 *****		Vendor # 9 *****		Vendor # 10 *****		
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Part #	Manufacturer	Description	Unit Cost	Est. Cost	Unit Cost	Est. Cost	Unit Cost	Est. Cost	Unit Cost	Est. Cost	Unit Cost	Est. Cost	Unit Cost	Est. Cost	Unit Cost	Est. Cost	Unit Cost	Est. Cost	Unit Cost	Est. Cost	
26	375	each	F0310009	Sole	Sole (Mittens) "Toasty" Palm® Capri & Lids, 12 Oz., Heavy Ultrathin™, 50/Pack	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$7,425.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$24.48	\$6,732.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
27	375	each	73181	Carolina	Cheer Fishing Line, 1000 Test, 40 Ft.	\$2.16	\$584.00	NO BID	\$550.00	NO BID	\$5.19	\$577.80	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
28	550	each	75822	Carolina	Iron Rings, 12 9	\$7.92	\$4,354.00	NO BID	\$3,575.00	NO BID	\$11.70	\$6,435.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
29	275	each	97510	Sandwich	Sand, Black, 1 lb	\$15.25	\$4,186.25	NO BID	\$1,376.00	NO BID	\$5.25	\$1,443.75	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
30	2,235	each	97268	Morton	Salt, 1 lb Bag	\$2.30	\$5,139.00	NO BID	\$5,470.00	NO BID	\$1.84	\$5,305.90	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
31	2,735	each	16300	Carolina	Aquarium Gravel, 1 lb - Light Colored	\$5.16	\$14,188.10	NO BID	\$4,017.00	NO BID	\$7.79	\$21,305.65	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
32	2,735	each	97217	Carolina	Super, 1 qt Pail	\$15.82	\$25,529.70	NO BID	\$25,513.50	NO BID	\$15.59	\$42,332.65	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
33	2,735	each	88740	Carolina	Sand, Fine, Laboratory Chemical Grade, 500 g	\$8.50	\$23,250.25	NO BID	\$34,765.25	NO BID	\$14.90	\$40,760.54	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
34	2,735	each	21-4058-12	Sand	Sand/Black Lumps (Whole Unit) Dried - 16 oz.	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$11,313.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
35	5,470	each	879108	Carolina	Paraffin Oil, White, Laboratory Grade, 500 ml.	\$13.00	\$71,110.00	NO BID	\$71,110.00	NO BID	\$19.95	\$109,134.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
36	46	pack	Item # 813796 - Model # 47246	Calum Products	4" x 6" Resealable Poly Bags, 3 Mil, Clear, 1000/Case	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$874.00	NO BID	\$16.24	\$747.04	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
37	275	pack	Unltd	712720	Paper, Filter, 12.5 cm, Pack of 100	\$7.75	\$2,131.25	NO BID	\$1,100.00	NO BID	\$5.46	\$1,501.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
38	33	pack	88	Dart	Dart 1 Cup (Hot/Cold Com. 8 Oz., White, 1000/Case)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$11,880.00	NO BID	\$41.18	\$1,368.94	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
39	267	each	974803	Carolina	Sock, Double Padded 20", 7 Inches, Pack of 32	\$5.11	\$1,364.37	NO BID	\$3,417.60	NO BID	\$7.55	\$2,015.85	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
40	267	each	9586-0000	Coors & Clark	COORS & CLARK Emery Slurry Upholstery Thrust, 150-Yard, Black	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$734.25	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
41	267	each	706637	Carolina	Hot Top Product Matches 32 matches per box	\$3.65	\$977.25	NO BID	\$881.10	NO BID	\$6.04	\$1,613.68	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
42	267	each	PP451533	Phyt	Phyt™ Plastic Hot Cup Lid, 8 Oz., White, 50/Pack	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2,403.00	NO BID	\$2.15	\$569.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
43	31	each	30097	Coast	Coast Alkaline Battery D-Cell Industrial Performance	\$27.40	\$1,019.20	NO BID	\$7,365.60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
44	1,077	each	756488	Carolina	MINIATURE Lamp, Pack of 10 - 1.5 WBS	\$14.50	\$15,516.50	NO BID	\$1,961.75	NO BID	\$4.21	\$4,534.17	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
45	93	each	921389	SC Johnson	Glue Seal Top Freezer Bag, Quart, 54-count, 6-pack	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$7,656.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
46	93	each	971818	Bayer	Mini-Printer Anesthetic Tables Pkts of 50	\$15.26	\$1,419.18	NO BID	\$837.00	NO BID	\$10.21	\$949.90	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

GROUP # 2

Item No. 26: Qty 375, UOM each, Part # F0310009, Manufacturer Sole, Description Sole (Mittens) "Toasty" Palm® Capri & Lids, 12 Oz., Heavy Ultrathin™, 50/Pack, Unit Cost NO BID, Est. Cost NO BID.

Item No. 27: Qty 375, UOM each, Part # 73181, Manufacturer Carolina, Description Cheer Fishing Line, 1000 Test, 40 Ft., Unit Cost \$2.16, Est. Cost \$584.00.

Item No. 28: Qty 550, UOM each, Part # 75822, Manufacturer Carolina, Description Iron Rings, 12 9, Unit Cost \$7.92, Est. Cost \$4,354.00.

Item No. 29: Qty 275, UOM each, Part # 97510, Manufacturer Sandwich, Description Sand, Black, 1 lb, Unit Cost \$15.25, Est. Cost \$4,186.25.

Item No. 30: Qty 2,235, UOM each, Part # 97268, Manufacturer Morton, Description Salt, 1 lb Bag, Unit Cost \$2.30, Est. Cost \$5,139.00.

Item No. 31: Qty 2,735, UOM each, Part # 16300, Manufacturer Carolina, Description Aquarium Gravel, 1 lb - Light Colored, Unit Cost \$5.16, Est. Cost \$14,188.10.

Item No. 32: Qty 2,735, UOM each, Part # 97217, Manufacturer Carolina, Description Super, 1 qt Pail, Unit Cost \$15.82, Est. Cost \$25,529.70.

Item No. 33: Qty 2,735, UOM each, Part # 88740, Manufacturer Carolina, Description Sand, Fine, Laboratory Chemical Grade, 500 g, Unit Cost \$8.50, Est. Cost \$23,250.25.

Item No. 34: Qty 2,735, UOM each, Part # 21-4058-12, Manufacturer Sand, Description Sand/Black Lumps (Whole Unit) | Dried - 16 oz., Unit Cost NO BID, Est. Cost NO BID.

Item No. 35: Qty 5,470, UOM each, Part # 879108, Manufacturer Carolina, Description Paraffin Oil, White, Laboratory Grade, 500 ml., Unit Cost \$13.00, Est. Cost \$71,110.00.

Item No. 36: Qty 46, UOM pack, Part # Item # 813796 - Model # 47246, Manufacturer Calum Products, Description 4" x 6" Resealable Poly Bags, 3 Mil, Clear, 1000/Case, Unit Cost NO BID, Est. Cost NO BID.

Item No. 37: Qty 275, UOM pack, Part # Unltd, Manufacturer 712720, Description Paper, Filter, 12.5 cm, Pack of 100, Unit Cost \$7.75, Est. Cost \$2,131.25.

Item No. 38: Qty 33, UOM pack, Part # 88, Manufacturer Dart, Description Dart 1 Cup (Hot/Cold Com. 8 Oz., White, 1000/Case), Unit Cost NO BID, Est. Cost NO BID.

Item No. 39: Qty 267, UOM each, Part # 974803, Manufacturer Carolina, Description Sock, Double Padded 20", 7 Inches, Pack of 32, Unit Cost \$5.11, Est. Cost \$1,364.37.

Item No. 40: Qty 267, UOM each, Part # 9586-0000, Manufacturer Coors & Clark, Description COORS & CLARK Emery Slurry Upholstery Thrust, 150-Yard, Black, Unit Cost NO BID, Est. Cost NO BID.

Item No. 41: Qty 267, UOM each, Part # 706637, Manufacturer Carolina, Description Hot Top Product Matches 32 matches per box, Unit Cost \$3.65, Est. Cost \$977.25.

Item No. 42: Qty 267, UOM each, Part # PP451533, Manufacturer Phyt, Description Phyt™ Plastic Hot Cup Lid, 8 Oz., White, 50/Pack, Unit Cost NO BID, Est. Cost NO BID.

Item No. 43: Qty 31, UOM each, Part # 30097, Manufacturer Coast, Description Coast Alkaline Battery D-Cell Industrial Performance, Unit Cost \$27.40, Est. Cost \$1,019.20.

Item No. 44: Qty 1,077, UOM each, Part # 756488, Manufacturer Carolina, Description MINIATURE Lamp, Pack of 10 - 1.5 WBS, Unit Cost \$14.50, Est. Cost \$15,516.50.

Item No. 45: Qty 93, UOM each, Part # 921389, Manufacturer SC Johnson, Description Glue Seal Top Freezer Bag, Quart, 54-count, 6-pack, Unit Cost NO BID, Est. Cost NO BID.

Item No. 46: Qty 93, UOM each, Part # 971818, Manufacturer Bayer, Description Mini-Printer Anesthetic Tables Pkts of 50, Unit Cost \$15.26, Est. Cost \$1,419.18.

CITY OF YONKERS / YONKERS PUBLIC SCHOOLS		PURCHASING DEPARTMENT		BUYER'S INFORMATION		ITEM INFORMATION		BID INFORMATION	
Yonkers, New York 10791-4888 Phone 914-377-6031		Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 1)		Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 2)		Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 3)		Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 4)	
Name: Nicole Galdi		Name: Nicole Galdi		Name: Nicole Galdi		Name: Nicole Galdi		Name: Nicole Galdi	
Address: 200 York St., Yonkers, NY 10791-4888		Address: 111 Broadway, Stamford, NY 12505		Address: 6081 Oxford Drive, Phoenicia, NY 12150		Address: 4500 South Wyckoff Drive # 1M, Houston, TX 77067		Address: Pacific Rim Corporation, Houston, TX 77067	
Manufacturer:		Manufacturer:		Manufacturer:		Manufacturer:		Manufacturer:	
Part #		Part #		Part #		Part #		Part #	
UOM		UOM		UOM		UOM		UOM	
OR EQUAL		OR EQUAL		OR EQUAL		OR EQUAL		OR EQUAL	
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Unit Cost	Est. Cost	Unit Cost	Est. Cost	Unit Cost	Est. Cost
47	93	3M	Post-it Notes, 3" x 3", Canary Collection, 90 Sheet/Pack, 24 Pack/Pack	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
			Post-it Notes, 3" x 3", Canary Collection, 90 Sheet/Pack, 24 Pack/Pack	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
			Post-it Notes, 3" x 3", Canary Collection, 90 Sheet/Pack, 24 Pack/Pack	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
TOTAL BID FOR ITEMS 26 TO 47, INCLUSIVE					\$188,792.20		\$207,408.89		\$531,255.40

CITY OF YONKERS / YONKERS PUBLIC SCHOOLS		BID NO: RFB-7088									
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT		Bid Opening Date: 1/24/2024									
One Larkin Center		Total Bids Rec'd: 5									
Yonkers, New York 10701-3888		Item: Furnish & Deliver Various Science Lab Supplies & Equipment (GROUP # 3)									
Phone 914-577-6031		Buyer: Nicole Galdi									
GROUP # 3		*****Vendor # 1*****									
Name:.....		*****Vendor # 2*****									
Address:		*****Vendor # 3*****									
8088 General Drive		Pacific Star Corporation									
Plymouth, MI 48170		4330 South Wayside Drive # 106									
*****Vendor # 4*****		Wheat Hempstead, NY 14586									
Certified M/W/B/E: No		Certified M/W/B/E: No									
Woman/Minority Owned: No		Woman/Minority Owned: No									
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Part #	Manufacturer	Description	Unit Cost	Ext. Cost	Unit Cost	Ext. Cost	Unit Cost	Ext. Cost
48	870	each	291532	Carolina	Individual Basic Science Microscope Slides - human hair straight & human hair curly	\$2.00	\$1,740.00	\$19.51	\$16,973.70	\$4.75	\$4,132.50
	OR EQUAL:										
49	870	each	291418	Carolina	Individual Basic Science Microscope Slides - Threads	\$2.25	\$1,957.50	\$20.37	\$17,721.90	\$5.25	\$4,567.50
	OR EQUAL:										
50	870	each	291456	Carolina	Slides containing - Sand slide w.m.	\$1.50	\$1,305.00	\$18.58	\$16,164.60	\$7.75	\$6,742.50
	OR EQUAL:										
51	870	each	296932	Carolina	Paramecium, Fission, w.m., Microscope Slide	\$3.50	\$3,045.00	\$28.73	\$24,995.10	\$7.75	\$6,742.50
	OR EQUAL:										
52	870	each	295666	Carolina	Euglena Microscope Slide, w.m.	\$2.50	\$2,175.00	\$19.15	\$16,660.50	\$4.42	\$3,845.40
	OR EQUAL:										
53	870	each	303932	Carolina	Eloides Stern, c.s., Microscope Slide	\$2.25	\$1,957.50	\$20.37	\$17,721.90	\$4.52	\$3,932.40
	OR EQUAL:										
54	870	each	296010	Carolina	Budding Yeast w.m. Microscope Slide	\$3.00	\$2,610.00	\$20.65	\$17,965.50	\$4.96	\$4,315.20
	OR EQUAL:										
55	870	each	312540	Carolina	Stratified Squamous Epithelium Microscope Slides	\$3.00	\$2,610.00	\$26.80	\$23,316.00	\$4.50	\$3,915.00
	OR EQUAL:										
56	870	each	312570	Carolina	Mammal Giant Multipolar Neurons Slide, Smear, Luxol Fast Blue	\$2.50	\$2,175.00	\$22.51	\$19,583.70	\$4.24	\$3,688.80
	OR EQUAL:										
57	870	each	309680	Carolina	Leaf Epidermis Microscope Slides - Onion Bulb (sedum, illium, allium), w.m.	\$2.00	\$1,740.00	\$19.51	\$16,973.70	\$4.00	\$3,480.00
	OR EQUAL:										
58	870	each	302384	Carolina	Onion Root Tip Microscope Slides, 1.s. thin	\$3.50	\$3,045.00	\$23.87	\$20,766.90	\$8.25	\$7,177.50
	OR EQUAL:										
TOTAL BID FOR ITEMS 48 TO 58, INCLUSIVE						\$24,360.00	\$204,843.50	\$52,539.30			