

Board of Contract and Supply **Abstract of Bids**

10/30/2018

BUREAU OF PURCHASING				Buyer: K. Sansevere					
City of Yonkers				Bids Rec'd.: 2					
One Larkin Center									
Yonkers, NY 10701									
(914) 376-8056									
BID DATE	October 12, 2018	*****Vendor #1*****		*****Vendor #2*****					
BID NO.	RFB-6320	EAI Education		Lakeshore Equipment					
Purchase of Various Classroom Science Supplies				118 Bauer Drive		2695 E. Dominguez Street			
				Oakland, NJ 07436		Carson, CA 90895			
				Certified M/WBE: NO		Certified M/WBE: NO			
				Woman/Minority Owned: NO		Woman/Minority Owned: NO			
ITEM	QTY.	Units	***ITEM DESCRIPTION***	MFR./MODEL	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	MFR./MODEL	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST
1	70	Each	Lakeshore Item # DD350X Learning Activity Tubs or approved equal	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	Lakeshore #DD350X	1, \$461.58	\$32,310.60
2	70	Each	Lakeshore Item # LC935X Marker Space Carty or approved equal	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	Lakeshore #LC935X	2, \$646.58	\$45,260.60
3	82	Each	SI Manufacturing Item # 505021 Sticky Meter Stick set of 30 or approved equal	SI #505021	\$8.03	\$658.46	Lakeshore #TE312	\$23.12	\$1,895.84
4	41	Each	Everyday Folding Shapes Class Set or approved equal	EAI Education #520437	\$111.56	\$4,573.96	Lakeshore #FG349	\$36.99	\$1,516.59
5	82	Each	EAI Education Item # 520724 Fractional Volume Cubes set of 140 or approved equal	EAI Education #520724	\$8.96	\$734.72	Lakeshore #LL897	\$23.12	\$1,895.84
6	82	Each	LENGANI GAMES Item #531540 Equivalent Fractions Playing Cards or approved equal	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	Lakeshore #FF899	\$12.02	\$985.64
7	41	Each	EAI Education Item # 532128 Shatterproof Ruler Assorted Colors set of 100 or approved equal	EAI Education #532128	\$31.93	\$1,309.13	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00
8	82	Each	EAI Education Item #533209 Quietshape Foam Algebra Tiles Classroom Kit or approved equal	EAI Education #533209	\$65.27	\$5,352.14	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00
9	41	Each	HELIX Item # 534131 Universal Locking Compass set of 100 tub or approved equal	Helix #534131	\$109.00	\$4,469.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00
10	82	Each	EAI Education Item # 534942 SmartPal Dry Erase Sleeves Classroom Kit Fluorescent or approved equal	EAI Education #534942	\$76.46	\$6,269.72	Lakeshore #GG379, LA138, RR423, WT363	\$113.30	\$9,290.60
TOTAL COST ITEMS 1-10:						\$23,367.13			\$93,155.71

Items 4 & 6 do they meet your needs Lakeshore or quoted equal.

H+2 @ 7/1/20

M/WBE