
RFB-6303 - Bid Abstract

BUREAU OF PURCHASING
1 Larkin Center, 3rd Floor
Yonkers, NY  10701
(914) 377-6030

BID DATE

BID NO.

TITLE:

Buyer: A. Correia

Bids Rec'd: 8

'+/-50%

ITEM QTY. ***ITEM DESCRIPTION*** MFG UNIT PRICE TOTAL COST MFG UNIT PRICE TOTAL COST MFG UNIT PRICE TOTAL COST MFG UNIT PRICE TOTAL COST MFG UNIT PRICE TOTAL COST

1 175
Dispensers: Evogen Dual Feminine Hygiene 

Dispenser (EVI-FREE) or Equal; Hospeco D1 $127.73000 $22,352.75

Hospeco EVI-

FREE $194.02000 $33,953.50

Hospeco EVI-

FREE $208.02 $36,403.50

Hospeco/ MT-

1 $167.92000 $29,386.00 Hospeco $214.00000 $37,450.00

2 175
Receptacles: Feminine Hygiene Waste 

Receptacle, White PPC Plastic or Equal; 

Hospeco 250-

201W $14.94000 $2,614.50

Hospeco 250-

201W $14.94000 $2,614.50

Hospeco 250-

201W $14.65 $2,563.75

Hospeco/CD

W $33.71000 $5,899.25

Hospeco 

#PPC $17.42000 $3,048.50

3 1200
Disposal Bags: Sensibles Personal Disposal 

Bags (SBX50) or Equal; Bags

Hospeco 

SBX50 $0.04500 $54.00

Hospeco 

SBX50 $0.04500 $54.00

Hospeco 

SBX50 $0.04 $52.84

Hospeco 

SBX50 $3.27125 $3,925.50

Hospeco 

SBX50 $0.04958 $59.50

4 10
Waxed Paper Liners (HS-6141) or Equal; (10 

cs/250 per case

Hospeco 

HS6141 $12.08000 $120.80

Hospeco 

HS6141 $12.08000 $120.80

Hospeco 

HS6141 $11.88 $118.80

Hospeco 

HS6141 $17.29000 $172.90

Hospeco 

HS6141 $13.29000 $132.90

5 10
Maxi-thin Maxipads (MT-4) or Equal; (10 

cs/250 per case 

Hospeco MT-

4 $24.03000 $240.30

Hospeco MT-

4 $24.03000 $240.30

Hospeco MT-

4 $23.87 $238.70

Hospeco MT-

4 $47.57000 $475.70

Hospeco MT-

4 $26.19000 $261.90

6 10
Tampax Tampon in vending tube (T-500) or 

Equal; (10 cs/5000 per case

Hospeco 

T500 $49.10000 $491.00

Hospeco 

T500 $49.10000 $491.00 Hospeco T55 $48.95 $489.50

Hospeco 

T500 $78.66000 $786.60

Hospeco 

T500 $54.43000 $544.30

***TOTAL PRICE*** $25,873.35 $37,474.10 $39,867.09 $40,645.95 $41,497.10

'+/-50%

ITEM QTY. ***ITEM DESCRIPTION*** MFG UNIT PRICE TOTAL COST MFG UNIT PRICE TOTAL COST MFG UNIT PRICE TOTAL COST MFG UNIT PRICE TOTAL COST

1 175
Dispensers: Evogen Dual Feminine Hygiene 

Dispenser (EVI-FREE) or Equal;

Hospeco EVI-

FREE $218.00000 $38,150.00

Hospeco EVI-

FREE $210.20000 $36,785.00 Hospeco $224.88000 $39,354.00 NO BID $0.00000 $0.00

2 175
Receptacles: Feminine Hygiene Waste 

Receptacle, White PPC Plastic or Equal; 

Hospeco 201 

W $15.00000 $2,625.00

Hospeco 250-

201W $14.80000 $2,590.00

Hospeco 250-

210W $15.85000 $2,773.75

ALPINE 451-

WHI $10.00000 $1,750.00

3 1200
Disposal Bags: Sensibles Personal Disposal 

Bags (SBX50) or Equal;

Hospeco 

SBX50 $0.04500 $54.00

Hospeco 

SBX50 $1.15400 $1,384.80 Hospeco $0.04760 $57.12 NO BID $0.00000 $0.00

4 10
Waxed Paper Liners (HS-6141) or Equal; (10 

cs/250 per case

Hospeco 

HS6141 $12.00000 $120.00

Hospeco 

HS6141 $15.60000 $156.00 Hospeco $12.85000 $128.50 NO BID $0.00000 $0.00

5 10
Maxi-thin Maxipads (MT-4) or Equal; (10 

cs/250 per case 

Hospeco MT-

4 $24.50000 $245.00

Hospeco MT-

4 $32.10000 $321.00 Hospeco $25.80000 $258.00 NO BID $0.00000 $0.00

6 10
Tampax Tampon in vending tube (T-500) or 

Equal; (10 cs/5000 per case

Hospeco 

T500 $50.00000 $500.00

Hospeco 

T500 $58.30000 $583.00 Hospeco $52.92000 $529.20 NO BID $0.00000 $0.00

***TOTAL PRICE*** $41,694.00 $41,819.80 $43,100.57 $1,750.00

June 29, 2018

RFB-6303

Purchase of 175 Hospeco Evogen EV1, or Equal, dual 

feminine hygiene dispensers and related accessories

VENDOR NON-RESPONSIVE: FAILED 

TO PROVIDE PRICING ON ALL BUT 

ONE ITEM

******Vendor # 1******

Certified M/WBE: NO

Woman/Minority Owned: NO

******Vendor # 1****** ALT

Certified M/WBE: NO

Woman/Minority Owned: NO

******Vendor # 3******

Certified M/WBE: NO

Woman/Minority Owned: NO

******Vendor # 2******

Certified M/WBE: NO

50 Jeanne Drive

******Vendor # 4******

Certified M/WBE: NO

Strauss Paper Company

10 Slater Street

Portchester, NY 10573

Woman/Minority Owned: NO

******Vendor # 5****** ******Vendor # 6****** ******Vendor # 7****** ******Vendor # 8******

Woman/Minority Owned: NO

ADDITIONAL BID PACKAGE SUBMITTED 

WITH ALTERNATE FOR ITEM # 1

Cleaning Systems Bob Barker Company Sterling Sanitary Supply Corp Triple A Supplies, Inc.

590 Franklin Ave 134 N. Main St. 32-32 57th Street

Certified M/WBE: NO Certified M/WBE: NO Certified M/WBE: NO Certified M/WBE: NO

MT Vernon, NY 10550 Fuquay-Varina, NC 27526 Woodside, NY 11377 Newburgh, NY 12550

Woman/Minority Owned: NO Woman/Minority Owned: NO Woman/Minority Owned: NO Woman/Minority Owned: NO

E.A Morse & Co., IncE.A Morse & Co., Inc
Bob Arnord Imperial Bag & Paper Co. LLC 

Burke Supply Division
WW Grainger

11-25 Harding St. 100 Grainger Parkway

Middletown, NY 10940

11-25 Harding St.

Middletown, NY 10941

255 Route 1 & 9

Jersey City, NJ 07306 Lake Forest, IL 60045


