



SOUTHERN WESTCHESTER BOCES

BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES

17 Berkley Drive, Rye Brook, New York 10573
(914) 937-3820 • Fax: (914) 937-7958

To: All Participating Vendors

From: Stephen Rutigliano
srutigliano@swboces.org
914.937.3820 x 4517

Date: June 8, 2020

Re: Office & Classroom Furniture #2019-20-C09
Contract Period: June 1, 2020 – May 31, 2022

We wish to take this opportunity to thank you for your participation in the Office and Classroom Furniture bid. The results of this bid will also be posted on the Southern Westchester BOCES website.

The award will be posted in two parts. Part one contains the Notice to Bidders which is the general terms and conditions of the bid and award and includes the Special Instructions for pricing and delivery terms and conditions as they pertain specifically to this bid.

Part two is an Excel spreadsheet with four worksheets for pricing information, a product cross reference chart, Vendor & Manufacturer chart, and vendor contact information.

Those of you who were successful bidders will find your names next to the items for which you are recommended in the "pricing information" spreadsheet.

Once again, we thank you for your continued interest in serving the Southern Westchester BOCES.

COMPONENT DISTRICTS: Ardsley, Blind Brook, Bronxville, Byram Hills, Dobbs Ferry, Eastchester Edgemont, Elmsford, Greenburgh Central Seven, Greenburgh Eleven, Greenburgh Graham, Greenburgh North Castle, Harrison, Hastings-on-Hudson, Hawthorne Cedar Knolls, Irvington, Mount Pleasant Blythedale, Mount Pleasant Central, Mount Pleasant Cottage, Mount Vernon, New Rochelle, Pelham, Pleasantville, Pocantico Hills, Port Chester, Rye City, Rye Neck, Scarsdale, The Tarrytowns, Tuckahoe, Valhalla, White Plains

E10	Groupe LaCasse	Furniture Pro	40.00	1,000.00	20	25	10	Limited Lifetime	15-60	2020	Y
E11	Highpoint	WB Mason	59.20	400.00	10	19.5	9.5	10 years	50	2020	Y
E12	HON	WB Mason	64.10	N/A	10	15	10	Limited Lifetime	15-60	1/1/2020	Y
E13	HON Quick Ship	WB Mason	60.70	N/A	6	11	9	Lifetime	15	1/1/2020	Y
E14	Humanscale	WB Mason	45.00	150.00	10	19	11	15 years	30	5/18/2020	Y
E15	Mayline	WB Mason	56.00	N/A	8	14	8	Limited Lifetime	30-60	4/1/2020	Y
E16	Norsons	Furniture Pro	32.00	1,000.00	18	20	10	Limited Lifetime	3-20	2020	Y
E17	Phoenix Safe Internat'l	WB Mason	16.50	500.00	15	20	15	1 year	30-60	1/1/2019	Y
E18	RGS Furniture	WB Mason	18.00	200.00	15	20	15	2 years	40	2020	Y
E19	Screenflex Panel Systems	No Bid	-								
E20	Safco	School Specialty	35.00	400.00	10	20	20	Limited Lifetime	2-6 weeks	2020	Y
E21	Sandusky Lee	No Bid	-								
E22	Seating, Inc.	Furniture Pro	45.00	1,000.00	18	20	10	Limited Lifetime	20-30	2020	Y
E23	Swiftspace	No Bid	-								
E24	Varidesk	No Bid	-								
Category F: Early Childhood/Kindergarten											
F1	Bird In Hand	School Specialty	14.00	500.00	10	20	20	Lifetime Limited	10-60	2020	Y
F2	Carpets for Kids	WB Mason	30.00	500.00	10	20	20	5 years	20	2020	Y
F3	Copernicus	WB Mason	41.00	500.00	10	18	17	5 years	25	2020	Y
F4	Fleetwood	Nickerson	15.50	1,000.00	15	15	10	25 years	45-60	2020	Y
F5	Jonti-Craft	WB Mason	38.50	450.00	10	19	12	Lifetime	40	2020	Y
F6	Joy Carpets	School Specialty	27.00	500.00	10	20	20	varies	2-6 weeks	2020	Y
F7	Mahar Manufacturing	No Bid	-								
F9	Wood Designs	WB Mason	33.00	500.00	10	14	10	Limited Lifetime	30-45	2020	Y
Category G: Tables & Chairs											
G1	AmTab Manufacturing	HNE	20.00	500.00	20	20	10	10 year	40-90	2020	Y
G2	McCourt Manufacturing folding Tables	No Bid	-								
G3	MidWest Folding Products	No Bid	-								
G4	Mity-Lite	WB Mason	38.20	600.00	10	20	10	5 years	30-90	2020	Y
G5	National Public Seating (Folding Chairs)	WB Mason	44.10	500.00	10	18	18	25 years	30-60	2/21/2020	Y
G6	Southern Aluminum - Lightweight Tables	No Bid	-								
G7	Special T	No Bid	-								
Category H: Cafeteria											
H1	ISI Interior Systems America	AT Equipment	25.00	1,000.00	15	25	10	5 year	45-60	2020	Y
H2	KI (Kreuger International)	No Bid	-								
H3	McCourt Manufacturing Folding Tables	No Bid	-								
H4	Midwest Folding Products	No Bid	-								
H5	Mitchell	No Bid	-								