
BUREAU OF PURCHASING

City of Yonkers

One Larkin Center

Yonkers, NY  10701

(914) 376-8056

BID DATE May 18, 2020

BID NO. RFB-6514

TITLE:

ITEM No. QTY. ***ITEM DESCRIPTION*** 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9

1 1 Type C/D Vehicle - 66 pass. In-District 20 Days First Student, Inc Mat Bus Corp Academy Bus Corp Royal Coach Lines VP Bus, LLC All County Bus, LLC First Steps Transportation Little Heros Bus Corp Yellow Star, Inc

Vehicle 400.00$                                  450.00$                     525.00$                        527.63$                     772.27$                        No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monitor 140.00$                                  150.00$                     100.00$                        165.00$                     211.01$                        No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total per vehicle 540.00$                                  600.00$                     625.00$                        692.63$                     983.28$                        -$                                       -$                                       -$                               -$                    

2 1 Type A/B Vehicle - 20 pass. In-District 30 Days First Steps Transportation Academy Bus Corp First Student, Inc Mat Bus Corp Royal Coach Lines VP Bus, LLC All County Bus, LLC Little Heros Bus Corp Yellow Star, Inc

Vehicle 323.00$                                  375.00$                     367.00$                        390.00$                     432.45$                        633.41$                                  No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monitor 99.00$                                    100.00$                     140.00$                        150.00$                     165.00$                        211.01$                                  No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total per vehicle 422.00$                                  475.00$                     507.00$                        540.00$                     597.45$                        844.42$                                  -$                                       -$                               -$                    

3 1 Type A/B Vehicle - 20 pass. Out-of-District 30 Days First Steps Transportation First Student, Inc Mat Bus Corp All County Bus, LLC Royal Coach Lines VP Bus, LLC Academy Bus Corp Little Heros Bus Corp Yellow Star, Inc

Vehicle 323.00$                                  367.00$                     395.00$                        400.00$                     491.20$                        755.84$                                  No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monitor 99.00$                                    140.00$                     150.00$                        150.00$                     165.00$                        211.01$                                  No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total per vehicle 422.00$                                  507.00$                     545.00$                        550.00$                     656.20$                        966.85$                                  -$                                       -$                               -$                    

4 1 Type A/B Vehicle - 20 (WC) pass. In-District 30 Days First Student, Inc Mat Bus Corp Royal Coach Lines Academy Bus Corp All County Bus, LLC First Steps Transportation VP Bus, LLC Little Heros Bus Corp Yellow Star, Inc

Vehicle 387.00$                                  395.00$                     483.30$                        No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monitor 140.00$                                  150.00$                     165.00$                        No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total per vehicle 527.00$                                  545.00$                     648.30$                        -$                           -$                              -$                                       -$                                       -$                               -$                    

5 1 Type A/B Vehicle - 20 (WC) pass. Out-of-District 30 Days Mat Bus Corp First Student, Inc All County Bus, LLC Royal Coach Lines Academy Bus Corp First Steps Transportation VP Bus, LLC Little Heros Bus Corp Yellow Star, Inc

Vehicle 380.00$                                  407.00$                     450.00$                        507.40$                     No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monitor 150.00$                                  147.00$                     175.00$                        165.00$                     No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total per vehicle 530.00$                                  554.00$                     625.00$                        672.40$                     -$                              -$                                       -$                                       -$                               -$                    

6 1 Type III - Caravans Out-of-District 30 days First Steps Transportation First Student, Inc Mat Bus Corp All County Bus, LLC Academy Bus Corp VP Bus, LLC Royal Coach Lines Little Heros Bus Corp Yellow Star, Inc

Vehicle 323.00$                                  350.00$                     350.00$                        400.00$                     550.00$                        631.37$                                  No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monitor 99.00$                                    147.00$                     150.00$                        120.00$                     150.00$                        211.01$                                  No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total per vehicle 422.00$                                  497.00$                     500.00$                        520.00$                     700.00$                        842.38$                                  -$                                       -$                               -$                    

Category # 7 - Summer Transportation

Line # 1 - Summer Transportation (Currently Approx. 4 hr. Buses)
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Bid Due Date -June 12, 2020




